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Desireless action is typically cited as a criterion of the liberated person in classical Indian texts.
Contemporary authors argue with near unanimity that since all action is motivated by desire, desireless
action is a contradiction. They conclude that desireless action is action performed without certain desires;
other desires are permissible.

In this book, the author surveys the contemporary literature on desireless action and argues that the
arguments for the standard interpretation are unconvincing. He translates, interprets, and evaluates passages
from a number of seminal classical Sanskrit texts, and argues that the doctrine of desireless action should
indeed be taken literally, as the advice to act without any desire at all. The author argues that the theories of
motivation advanced in these texts are not only consistent, but plausible.

This book is the first in-depth analysis of the doctrine of desireless action in Indian philosophy. It serves as a
reference to both contemporary and classical literature on the topic, and will be of interest to scholars of
Indian philosophy, religion, the Bhagavadgita and Hinduism.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Gutierrez:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book Desire and Motivation in Indian Philosophy (Routledge Hindu
Studies Series). You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. So long as we know about
how is important any book Desire and Motivation in Indian Philosophy (Routledge Hindu Studies Series).
You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, simply because
from book you can know everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you may be known.
About simple factor until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we can easily open a book as well
as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the
library. Let's learn.

Maxine Elam:

What do you regarding book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time?
What did you do? All people has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question simply
because just their can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct.
Because start from on pre-school until university need this Desire and Motivation in Indian Philosophy
(Routledge Hindu Studies Series) to read.

Brandon Riddle:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book and also novel and Desire and Motivation in Indian Philosophy (Routledge
Hindu Studies Series) or others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the fantastic a
book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher as well as students
especially. Those publications are helping them to bring their knowledge. In various other case, beside
science reserve, any other book likes Desire and Motivation in Indian Philosophy (Routledge Hindu Studies
Series) to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Bernie Watts:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or to make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know
that on this age, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.



Therefore , this Desire and Motivation in Indian Philosophy (Routledge Hindu Studies Series) can make you
sense more interested to read.
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