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From the Nobel Prize-winning novelist, an inspired, thoughtful, and deeply personal book about reading and
writing novels.
 
In this fascinating set of essays, based on the talks he delivered at Harvard University as part of the
distinguished Norton Lecture series, Pamuk presents a comprehensive and provocative theory of the novel
and the experience of reading. Drawing on Friedrich Schiller’s famous distinction between “naïve”
writers—those who write spontaneously—and “sentimental” writers—those who are reflective and
aware—Pamuk reveals two unique ways of processing and composing the written word. He takes us through
his own literary journey and the beloved novels of his youth to describe the singular experience of reading.
Unique, nuanced, and passionate, this book will be beloved by readers and writers alike.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Haakenson:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and progress. Some of
you maybe may update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to you is you don't know which you should start with. This The Naive and the Sentimental
Novelist (Vintage International) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Timothy Brown:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, small story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not trying The Naive and the
Sentimental Novelist (Vintage International) that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by simply
reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world
better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading habit only
for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you
who want to start looking at as your good habit, you can pick The Naive and the Sentimental Novelist
(Vintage International) become your own starter.

Deana Smith:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its handle may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer may be The Naive and the Sentimental Novelist (Vintage
International) why because the great cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not
disappoint you. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will
directly guide you to pick up this book.

Julio Huntsman:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book method, more simple and reachable. This specific The Naive and the Sentimental Novelist (Vintage
International) can give you a lot of close friends because by you considering this one book you have matter
that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for
you to get success. This book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't know, by knowing more
than some other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We should have The Naive and the
Sentimental Novelist (Vintage International).
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