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"Have the courage to use your own understanding! - that is the motto of enlightenment." - Immanuel Kant

The Enlightenment is one of the most important and contested periods in the history of philosophy. The
problems it addressed, such as the proper extent of individual freedom and the challenging of tradition,
resonate as much today as when they were first debated. Of all philosophers, it is arguably Kant who took
such questions most seriously, addressing them above all in his celebrated short essay, An Answer to the
Question: What is Enlightenment?

In this engaging and lucid book, Samuel Fleischacker first explains and assesses Kant’s philosophy of
Enlightenment. He then considers critics of Kant’s views - from Burke and Hegel to Horkheimer and Adorno
- and figures he regards as having extended Kant’s notion of enlightenment, such as Feuerbach, Marx,
Habermas, Foucault, and Rawls.

Throughout, he demonstrates how Kant holds two distinct theories of enlightenment. On the one hand, Kant
proposes a ‘minimal’ view, where to be enlightened is simply to engage in critical public discussion,
allowing diversity of opinion to flourish. On the other, he argues that Kant elsewhere calls for a ‘maximal’
view of enlightenment, where, for example, an enlightened person cannot believe in a traditional religion.
With great skill Fleischacker shows how these two views are taken in a multitude of directions by both
critics and advocates of Kant’s philosophy.

Arguing that Kant’s minimal enlightenment is a precondition for a healthy proliferation of cultures, religious
faiths and political movements, What is Enlightenment? is a fascinating introduction to a key aspect of
Kant’s thought and a compelling analysis of philosophical thinking about the Enlightenment. Including
helpful chapter summaries and guides to further reading, it is ideal for anyone studying Kant or the
philosophy of the Enlightenment, as well as those in related disciplines such as politics, history and religious
studies.
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From reader reviews:

David Lalonde:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem or maybe exercise. Well,
probably you'll have this What is Enlightenment? (Kant's Questions).

Donna Nichols:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Studying a book can
help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this What is Enlightenment? (Kant's Questions) book
because this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per
cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Jack Godina:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside look likes. Maybe
you answer can be What is Enlightenment? (Kant's Questions) why because the excellent cover that make
you consider about the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside
or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Virginia Laird:

You are able to spend your free time you just read this book this book. This What is Enlightenment? (Kant's
Questions) is simple to develop you can read it in the area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not
include much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you simpler
to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when one buys this book.
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