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After spending another family wedding fielding questions about her non-existent love life, Kelsey Noble
decides she’s tired of waiting around for things she could go out and get herself. What Kelsey wants is a
baby, and she doesn’t see any point waiting for a husband she’s not even sure she wants. But a mix-up at the
fertility clinic lands her with a hassle she didn’t count on. A big, muscular hassle in a Stetson and cowboy
boots.

Cole Mitchell is shocked to discover that a grand gesture from years past has come back to haunt him. Now,
thanks to a clerical error, a woman he’s never met is having his baby—and there’s no way he’s going to walk
away and forget he has a child.

Trying to make nice with the unexpected father of her baby lands Kelsey in Silver Creek, Oregon, dealing
with the kind of small town life she left behind years ago. Even worse is dealing with the burning attraction
she feels for Cole. She knows adding sex to the mix is a very bad idea, but she’s not sure how long she can
resist falling for the last man she ever expected…
 

Includes a preview of Maisey Yates’ novella, Unbuttoned.  

Praise for UNBUTTONED:

“I loved Unbuttoned by Maisey Yates in a big way….I love a feisty heroine and a charismatic hero,
especially when they clash. The scenes where they duked it out verbally, all the while undressing each other
mentally, were so delicious….Lots of fun.”—Smart Bitches, Trashy Books

“A sexy, compelling read…. it’s a great start to what looks to be a promising new small-town contemporary
series and has introduced me to a new-to-me author who writes enjoyable characters with great emotional
depth, witty dialogue, and steamy love scenes.”—Ramblings From This Chick

“Maisey Yates is a very talented author and has created the perfect small-town romance about two people
that found love once they learned to take a leap of faith…. I can’t wait to see what is in store for the residents
of Silver Creek.”—Books-N-Kisses
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From reader reviews:

Homer Douglas:

This book untitled Unexpected (A Silver Creek Romance Book 1) to be one of several books that best seller
in this year, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to
buy this specific book in the book retail store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher with this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Cell
phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this guide from your list.

Jason Allen:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Unexpected (A Silver
Creek Romance Book 1), you are able to enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still wish to miss it?
What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on
its known as reading friends.

Mary Peterson:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended for you is Unexpected (A Silver Creek Romance Book 1) this book consist a lot of the
information with the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented just how can the world
has grown up. The dialect styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. This is why this book ideal all of you.

Delaine Valencia:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Unexpected (A Silver
Creek Romance Book 1) can be the answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of
date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
textbooks have than the others?
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