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Perhaps the most highly regarded French filmmaker after Jean Renoir, Robert Bresson created a new kind of
cinema through meticulous refinement of the form's grammatical and expressive possibilities. In thirteen
features over a forty-year career, he held to an uncompromising moral vision and aesthetic rigor that remain
unmatched. Robert Bresson: A Passion for Film is the first comprehensive study to give equal attention to
the films, their literary sources, and psycho-biographical aspects of the work. Concentrating on the films'
cinematographic, imagistic, narrative, and thematic structures, Pipolo provides a nuanced analysis of each
film-including nearly 100 illustrations-elucidating Bresson's unique style as it evolved from the impassioned
Les Anges du p?che to such disconsolate meditations on the world as The Devil Probably and L'Argent.
Special attention is also given to psychosexual aspects of the films that are usually neglected. Bresson has
long needed a thoroughgoing treatment by a critic worthy to the task: he gets it here. From it emerges a
provocative portrait of an extraordinary artist whose moral engagement and devotion to the craft of
filmmaking are without equal.
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From reader reviews:

Adria Jenkins:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't
like reading a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you will need this Robert Bresson: A Passion for Film.

Elida Allman:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this aren't like that. This Robert Bresson: A Passion for Film book is readable simply by you who hate those
straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving
possibly decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer connected with Robert Bresson: A
Passion for Film content conveys thinking easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book
are not different in the information but it just different such as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Robert
Bresson: A Passion for Film is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Katherin Buerger:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-book
method, more simple and reachable. That Robert Bresson: A Passion for Film can give you a lot of good
friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have matter that they don't and make anyone more
like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success. This e-book offer you
information that perhaps your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than other make you to be great men
and women. So , why hesitate? Let's have Robert Bresson: A Passion for Film.

Christina Pena:

That publication can make you to feel relax. That book Robert Bresson: A Passion for Film was colourful
and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Robert Bresson: A Passion for Film has many
kinds or category. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read
and think that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it
offers up you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like
reading in which.
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