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Recalling his growing-up years in Los Angeles following World War II, author James Pratt describes twelve
lessons he learned from observing his father, an unpretentious and uneducated man who acquired little of this
world's wealth but who lived an honorable life. 'For some, these twelve virtues may seem antiquated, out of
date, or hopelessly provincial,' writes Pratt. 'I don't see it that way. What my father practiced and conveyed to
me were principles that made it possible for children to grow up in a stable, two-parent home, where there
was a widely accepted code of decency, honesty, honor, and patriotism.'

This book recalls simpler times, when Southern California was still filled with dusty little towns and when a
man could have purchased the bean fields that have become LAX for $5 an acre - if he had somehow had
five dollars. Readers will enjoy this loving retrospective, a fitting tribute to dads everywhere.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Davis:

The book Dad: The Man Who Lied to Save the Planet can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the best thing like a book Dad: The Man
Who Lied to Save the Planet? Wide variety you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim this
book can give many data for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer together with your book.
Knowledge or information that you take for that, you can give for each other; you can share all of these.
Book Dad: The Man Who Lied to Save the Planet has simple shape but you know: it has great and big
function for you. You can search the enormous world by start and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Susan Velez:

You may spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This Dad: The Man Who Lied to
Save the Planet is simple to develop you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train as well as soon. If
you did not include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you
quicker to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when one buys this book.

Lola Hernandez:

Beside this particular Dad: The Man Who Lied to Save the Planet in your phone, it could give you a way to
get nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from
the oven so don't be worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have
Dad: The Man Who Lied to Save the Planet because this book offers to you personally readable information.
Do you occasionally have book but you don't get what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you
have this in the hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful
island. Use you still want to miss the item? Find this book along with read it from today!

Darlene Lewis:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Dad: The Man Who Lied to Save the Planet was
multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Dad: The Man Who Lied to Save
the Planet has many kinds or style. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Detective Conan
you can read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you bored,
any it makes you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading
that.
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