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A former postman and long-term alcoholic who did not become a full-time writer until middle age, Charles
Bukowski was the author of autobiographical novels that captured the low life--including Post Office,
Factotum, and Women--and made him a literary celebrity, with a major Hollywood film (Barfly) based on
his life. Drawing on new interviews with virtually all of Bukowski's friends, family, and many lovers;
unprecedented access to his private letters and unpublished writing; and commentary from Norman Mailer,
Allen Ginsberg, Sean Penn, Mickey Rourke, Lawrence Ferlinghetti, R. Crumb, and Harry Dean Stanton,
Howard Sounes has uncovered the extraordinary true story of the Dirty Old Man of American literature.
Illustrated with drawings by Bukowski and over sixty photographs, Charles Bukowski is a must for
Bukowski devotees and new readers alike. As the Los Angeles Times noted, "Bukowski is one of those
writers people remember more for the legend than for the work....but, as Howard Sounes shows in this
exhaustively researched biography, it wasn't the whole story."
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From reader reviews:

Eric Vegas:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider when
those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously which
one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you get it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen in you if you take Charles Bukowski: Locked in the Arms of a Crazy Life as the
daily resource information.

Nancy Figaro:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a book you will get new information because book is one of numerous ways to share
the information or even their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially fictional book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the characters do
it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Charles Bukowski:
Locked in the Arms of a Crazy Life, you may tells your family, friends along with soon about yours e-book.
Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a book.

Brenda Seddon:

Typically the book Charles Bukowski: Locked in the Arms of a Crazy Life has a lot associated with on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was authored by the very famous author.
The author makes some research just before write this book. This book very easy to read you can find the
point easily after reading this book.

Kenneth Jordan:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to your account is Charles Bukowski: Locked in the Arms of a Crazy Life this publication
consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. This book was represented how do the
world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the
writer made some study when he makes this book. That is why this book acceptable all of you.
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