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A frank and candid glimpse into the early life of the maturing poet.

Friedrich von Hardenberg, who later became known as the poet Novalis, kept a journal between April and
July 1797 that captured his moods, thoughts, and observations following the death of his fifteen-year-old
fiancée Sophie von Kühn and his dearly loved younger brother Erasmus. The journal’s short, day-to-day
entries allow a frank and candid glimpse into the inner life of the maturing poet, and are complemented by
selections from Hardenberg’s letters. Taken together, and read in conjunction with the fragments written
before, during, and shortly after this period of time, the journal and letters shed light on a process of self-
discovery during which Hardenberg became convinced of his poetic vocation and acknowledged this
conviction in an act of self-christening, as the poet Novalis.

“The Birth of Novalis … the title of which recalls the outworn image, actually dismantles the Novalis legend.
This invaluable biographical collection concentrates on the engagement to Sophie von Kühn, from the poet’s
meeting with the twelve-year-old to her excruciating death at just fifteen. … The diaries are filled with
references to social events, to conversations, meals, walks, and so on. There are also some fairly frank notes
on his sexual activity, what Novalis calls ‘the satisfaction of my fantastical desires.’” — The Times Literary
Supplement

“This book offers, for the very first time, a reliable and lucid translation into English of the most important
primary sources pertaining to the biography of the German Romantic poet-philosopher Novalis. Here we
glimpse the inner workings of a now legendary event: the transformation of the mining student Friedrich von
Hardenberg into the romantic poet Novalis. The idea to gather letters and supporting biographical material
from precisely this period and unite them into a single volume is both a masterly and welcome enterprise. It
finally allows an English-speaking audience direct access to one of the most fascinating and enduring love
relationships in literary history—that of Sophie von Kühn and Friedrich von Hardenberg. Donehower’s
insightful introduction and thoroughly readable commentary interspersed between the letters does a great
deal to separate the fact from the fiction and myth in Hardenberg’s biography.” — David W. Wood,
University of Paris IV, Sorbonne

“Making this material available in English is a great service and long overdue. It offers the materials to
contextualize Novalis’ other writings, showing how his work responds to his particular biographical context
(unavoidable, given the strong mythmaking surrounding Novalis’ personal losses and their
fictionalizations).” — Katherine Arens, author of Empire in Decline: Fritz Mauthner’s Critique of
Wilhelminian Germany

Bruce Donehower is Lecturer in the University Writing Program at the University of California at Davis. He
is the author of Miko, Little Hunter of the North.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Pina:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make these survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Yep,
by reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to remain than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of The Birth of Novalis: Friedrich von
Hardenberg's Journal of 1797, with Selected Letters and Documents (SUNY series, Intersections: Philosophy
and Critical Theory) book as beginning and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

Lloyd Schuler:

Do you considered one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold
on guys this aren't like that. This The Birth of Novalis: Friedrich von Hardenberg's Journal of 1797, with
Selected Letters and Documents (SUNY series, Intersections: Philosophy and Critical Theory) book is
readable by simply you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for
enjoyable reading experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The
writer involving The Birth of Novalis: Friedrich von Hardenberg's Journal of 1797, with Selected Letters and
Documents (SUNY series, Intersections: Philosophy and Critical Theory) content conveys the thought easily
to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just
different as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking The Birth of Novalis: Friedrich von Hardenberg's Journal of
1797, with Selected Letters and Documents (SUNY series, Intersections: Philosophy and Critical Theory) is
not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Griselda Gonzalez:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their free time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, gonna beach,
or picnic inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill
your no cost time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read.
If you want to attempt look for book, may be the book untitled The Birth of Novalis: Friedrich von
Hardenberg's Journal of 1797, with Selected Letters and Documents (SUNY series, Intersections: Philosophy
and Critical Theory) can be fine book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Michael Blossom:

The reason? Because this The Birth of Novalis: Friedrich von Hardenberg's Journal of 1797, with Selected



Letters and Documents (SUNY series, Intersections: Philosophy and Critical Theory) is an unordinary book
that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap this but latter it will shock you with the secret the idea
inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such awesome way
makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning
completely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it.
This unique book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book possess such as help improving your
expertise and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I
will go to the publication store hurriedly.
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