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In this book, Dr. Jamal Wakim argues that the success or failure of Syria's policies is directly linked to the
degree to which these policies accord with those of Iraq, Turkey, Egypt and Saudi Arabia, and that it has
been subject throughout its history to competition between the forces occupying the geostrategic spheres that
surround it. He further argues that the influence of these spheres is not restricted to foreign policy, but also
extends to interaction with cultural, economic and social groups, thus transforming the geo-political to geo-
cultural, geoeconomic and geo-social. Ordered chronologically, the book deals chapter-by-chapter with the
different conflicts and struggles that have surrounded Syria throughout history, detailing the constant
struggles to control it by Mesopotania, Anatolia and Egypt. The book attempts to understand the political
changes that have taken place during the term of President Bashar Assad, including the role of the
'superpowers' in seeking to achieve control of the region; and concludes that whoever controls Syria can
tighten their grip on Iraq, Turkey and Egypt, and thus the whole of the Middle East.
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From reader reviews:

Terri Root:

The book The Struggle of Major Powers Over Syria, The make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
should use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you
getting pressure or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make studying a book The
Struggle of Major Powers Over Syria, The for being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages,
like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You are able to know everything
if you like available and read a reserve The Struggle of Major Powers Over Syria, The. Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this book?

Tara Huber:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content.
We all know that that book is very important usually. The book The Struggle of Major Powers Over Syria,
The ended up being making you to know about other information and of course you can take more
information. It is extremely advantages for you. The guide The Struggle of Major Powers Over Syria, The is
not only giving you considerably more new information but also to be your friend when you experience
bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship using the book
The Struggle of Major Powers Over Syria, The. You never feel lose out for everything in the event you read
some books.

Marsha Gleason:

It is possible to spend your free time you just read this book this book. This The Struggle of Major Powers
Over Syria, The is simple to deliver you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train and also soon. If
you did not get much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you
much easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when one buys this book.

Karin Decker:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from a book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of
news. On this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just seeking the The Struggle of Major Powers Over Syria, The when you essential it?
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