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This early work by Robert E. Howard was originally published in 1931 and we are now republishing it with
a brand new introductory biography. 'Alleys of Peril' is a story in the Sailor Steve Costigan series about a
travelling boxer. Robert Ervin Howard was born in Peaster, Texas in 1906. During his youth, his family
moved between a variety of Texan boomtowns, and Howard – a bookish and somewhat introverted child –
was steeped in the violent myths and legends of the Old South. At fifteen Howard began to read the pulp
magazines of the day, and to write more seriously. The December 1922 issue of his high school newspaper
featured two of his stories, 'Golden Hope Christmas' and 'West is West'. In 1924 he sold his first piece – a
short caveman tale titled 'Spear and Fang' – for $16 to the not-yet-famous Weird Tales magazine. Howard's
most famous character, Conan the Cimmerian, was a barbarian-turned-King during the Hyborian Age, a
mythical period of some 12,000 years ago. Conan featured in seventeen Weird Tales stories between 1933
and 1936 which is why Howard is now regarded as having spawned the 'sword and sorcery' genre. The
Conan stories have since been adapted many times, most famously in the series of films starring Arnold
Schwarzenegger.
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From reader reviews:

Hester Crutchfield:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A publication Alleys of Peril (Leather Lightning)
will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about everything. But
some of you think this open or reading a new book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they
can be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or appropriate book with you?

Sang Weems:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold
on guys this aren't like that. This Alleys of Peril (Leather Lightning) book is readable through you who hate
the straight word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience
without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer regarding Alleys of
Peril (Leather Lightning) content conveys the idea easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-
book are not different in the content material but it just different by means of it. So , do you nonetheless
thinking Alleys of Peril (Leather Lightning) is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Nathan Osborne:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, likely to beach,
or picnic inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your no cost time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the book untitled Alleys of Peril (Leather Lightning) can be fine book to read.
May be it could be best activity to you.

Catherine Graziani:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Alleys of Peril (Leather Lightning) can
be the respond to, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your spare
time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than
the others?
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