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Provides statistical tools and techniques needed to understand today's financial markets

The Second Edition of this critically acclaimed text provides a comprehensive and systematic introduction to
financial econometric models and their applications in modeling and predicting financial time series data.
This latest edition continues to emphasize empirical financial data and focuses on real-world examples.
Following this approach, readers will master key aspects of financial time series, including volatility
modeling, neural network applications, market microstructure and high-frequency financial data, continuous-
time models and Ito's Lemma, Value at Risk, multiple returns analysis, financial factor models, and
econometric modeling via computation-intensive methods.

The author begins with the basic characteristics of financial time series data, setting the foundation for the
three main topics:

Analysis and application of univariate financial time series●

Return series of multiple assets●

Bayesian inference in finance methods●

This new edition is a thoroughly revised and updated text, including the addition of S-Plus® commands and
illustrations. Exercises have been thoroughly updated and expanded and include the most current data,
providing readers with more opportunities to put the models and methods into practice. Among the new
material added to the text, readers will find:

Consistent covariance estimation under heteroscedasticity and serial correlation●

Alternative approaches to volatility modeling●

Financial factor models●

State-space models●

Kalman filtering●

Estimation of stochastic diffusion models●

The tools provided in this text aid readers in developing a deeper understanding of financial markets through
firsthand experience in working with financial data. This is an ideal textbook for MBA students as well as a
reference for researchers and professionals in business and finance.
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From reader reviews:

Louise Lewis:

This Analysis of Financial Time Series (Wiley Series in Probability and Statistics) book is absolutely not
ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book will
be information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper an
individual read a lot of information you will get. That Analysis of Financial Time Series (Wiley Series in
Probability and Statistics) without we understand teach the one who examining it become critical in thinking
and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Analysis of Financial Time Series (Wiley Series in Probability and
Statistics) can bring if you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you can
have it in your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Analysis of Financial Time Series (Wiley Series in
Probability and Statistics) having good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not truly feel
uninterested in reading.

Maribel Davenport:

The reserve untitled Analysis of Financial Time Series (Wiley Series in Probability and Statistics) is the
book that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to an
individual. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand.
The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, therefore the information that they share to
you personally is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Analysis of Financial Time Series
(Wiley Series in Probability and Statistics) from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Ardith Bobo:

The book untitled Analysis of Financial Time Series (Wiley Series in Probability and Statistics) contain a lot
of information on it. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very easy to
understand all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was published by
famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary works. It is easy to read this book
because you can please read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book throughout
anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site in addition to
order it. Have a nice study.

Catherine Benavidez:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This kind of Analysis of Financial Time Series (Wiley Series in
Probability and Statistics) can give you a lot of buddies because by you checking out this one book you have
issue that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one
step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that might be your friend doesn't realize, by
knowing more than additional make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let me have Analysis of
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