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This practical guide provides a comprehensive overview of professionally managed assets, or investments in
which all portfolio decisions and rebalancing are delegated to a fund manager or third-party advice service.
Savvy investors looking to achieve a better understanding of the nuances, benefits, and drawbacks of using
these products will find the answers they are looking for in The Handbook of Professionally Managed
Assets, no matter whether they would like to learn more about mutual funds or hedge funds.

There is a considerable lack of knowledge among the investing public about how to properly construct a
well-diversified portfolio of investments that includes a selection of professionally managed assets. As a
long-standing financial planner, attorney, and educator, Keith Fevurly remedies this issue in The Handbook
of Professionally Managed Assets by clearly presenting the major categories of professionally managed
assets and revealing the best tactics for investing in these vehicles. Along the way, he reveals each asset's
risks and rewards, and he also provides the in-depth knowledge and information investors need to
confidently select the right assets for their portfolios.

Filled with valuable insights for everyone from financial professionals to individual investors, The Handbook
of Professionally Managed Assets stands alone in its ability to shed light on the many investment vehicles
that fall under the larger umbrella of professionally managed assets. With topics as wide-ranging as mutual
funds, closed-end funds, unit investment trusts, exchange traded funds, hedge funds, managed futures, and
more, this invaluable resource will give you the information you need to build a prosperous financial future
for yourself and your clients. 

What you’ll learn

Among other topics, The Handbook of Professionally Managed Assets will cover:

Why financial advisors and sophisticated individual investors should use professionally managed assets as●

part of an overall investment strategy.
Mutual funds, including the history of their growth in the financial industry and the differences between●

actively and passively managed mutual funds.
The proper use of Unit Investment Trusts (UITs), particularly in the context of municipal bond trusts,●

which is the primary asset included in a UIT.
Who invests in hedge funds, including whether or not you should decide to invest in hedge funds as a self-●

directed investor.
Why managed futures are great assets to include in a risk-mitigating investment strategy for high-worth●

clients.



Who this book is for

Designed specifically for professional investment advisors and sophisticated individual investors, The
Handbook of Professionally Managed Assets will answer the myriad of questions financial professionals
have about everything from mutual funds to managed futures.
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From reader reviews:

Lupe Ware:

This The Handbook of Professionally Managed Assets: A Definitive Guide to Profiting from Alternative
Investments tend to be reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The reason of this The
Handbook of Professionally Managed Assets: A Definitive Guide to Profiting from Alternative Investments
can be one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple looking at food but
feed an individual with information that perhaps will shock your prior knowledge. This book is usually
handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed
versions. Beside that this The Handbook of Professionally Managed Assets: A Definitive Guide to Profiting
from Alternative Investments forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary,
giving you trial of critical thinking that could it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate
reading.

Gordon Rollins:

The e-book untitled The Handbook of Professionally Managed Assets: A Definitive Guide to Profiting from
Alternative Investments is the reserve that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the
guide content that will be shown to an individual. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are
easily to understand. The author was did a lot of analysis when write the book, and so the information that
they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of The Handbook of Professionally
Managed Assets: A Definitive Guide to Profiting from Alternative Investments from the publisher to make
you much more enjoy free time.

Shirley Davenport:

With this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of the books in the top list
in your reading list is The Handbook of Professionally Managed Assets: A Definitive Guide to Profiting
from Alternative Investments. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in
turning out to be precious person. By looking upwards and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Walter Son:

As a student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or
real their hobby. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there
but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't
see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for you. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many



ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this The Handbook of Professionally Managed Assets: A
Definitive Guide to Profiting from Alternative Investments can make you experience more interested to read.
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