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Various African nations have undergone conflict situations since they gained their independence. This book
focuses on particular countries that have faced conflict (civil wars and genocide) and are now in the process
of rebuilding their political, economic, social, and educational institutions. The countries that are addressed
in the book include: Rwanda, Mozambique, Sierra Leone, Liberia, and the Democratic Republic of the
Congo. In addition, there is a chapter that addresses the role of the African Diaspora in conflict and post-
conflict countries that include Eritrea, Liberia, and Somalia.

The book includes an examination of the various actors who are involved in post-conflict rebuilding and
reconstruction that involves internal and external participants. For example, it is clear that the internal actors
involve Africans themselves as ordinary citizens, members of local and national governments, and members
of non-governmental organizations. This allows the reader to understand the agency and empowerment of
Africans in post-conflict reconstruction. Various institutions are addressed within the context of the roles
they play in establishing governance organizations such as the Truth and Reconciliation Commission in
Sierra Leone, the African Union, chiefs in Liberia, and non-governmental organizations. Furthermore, the
external actors who are involved in post-conflict reconstruction are examined such as international non-
governmental organizations and the African Diaspora. They both have their own constituents and agendas
and can and do play a positive and negative role in post-conflict reconstruction. It is obvious that countries
that are addressed in the book are in dire need of financial assistant to rebuild much needed infrastructure
that was destroyed during the conflict. All of the countries covered in the book need schools, medical
facilities, roads, bridges, airports, ports, and the government does not have the money to provide these. This
is where the international non-governmental organizations and the African Diaspora play an important role.
The chapters that address these issues are cognizant of their importance and at the same time, the authors
realize that sovereignty can be undermined if Africans are not in the forefront of policy and decision making
that will determine their future.

There are chapters that provide a gendered analysis of post-conflict when it is appropriate. For example, it is
clear that women, men, boys, and girls experienced conflict in different ways because of their gender. They
all participated in the conflict in various ways. Consequently, the efforts at peace building are given a
gendered analysis in terms of what has happened to women and girls in the demobilization and rehabilitation
period including an excellent analysis of land reform in Rwanda and how that affects women and members
of a certain ethnic group that are often overlooked in the examination of the 1994 genocide.

This book provides a very good contribution to the literature on conflict and post-conflict African countries
because of its depth and the vast topics it embraces. It provides an analysis of the internal and external actors,
the role of gender in post-conflict decision making, and it provides the voices of ordinary Africans who were
affected by the conflict, and who are determined to live productive lives.
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Buch:

The book African Democracy and Development: Challenges for Post-Conflict African Nations can give
more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the best thing like a
book African Democracy and Development: Challenges for Post-Conflict African Nations? Wide variety you
have a different opinion about book. But one aim which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely
right. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you could give for
each other; you are able to share all of these. Book African Democracy and Development: Challenges for
Post-Conflict African Nations has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and large function for
you. You can look the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Donovan Houseman:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a publication you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways to share
the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
studying a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the figures do it
anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When you read this African Democracy and
Development: Challenges for Post-Conflict African Nations, it is possible to tells your family, friends along
with soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a e-book.

Mary Diaz:

The particular book African Democracy and Development: Challenges for Post-Conflict African Nations has
a lot of information on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by
the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research just before write this book. This kind of book very
easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this book.

William Sanders:

This African Democracy and Development: Challenges for Post-Conflict African Nations is new way for
you who has intense curiosity to look for some information because it relief your hunger of knowledge.
Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having small amount of digest in
reading this African Democracy and Development: Challenges for Post-Conflict African Nations can be the
light food for you because the information inside this book is easy to get through anyone. These books
produce itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book type. People who think
that in e-book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is not any in reading
a book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss that!
Just read this e-book style for your better life and knowledge.
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